ORDINANCE NO., 2302

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SANTA ROSA REPEALING ORDIMANCE NUMBERS 798,

2052, 2054 and 2173 AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES AS CODIFIED IN CHAPTER & OF THE
SANTA ROSA CITY CODE ENTITLED “BUILLDING REGULATICNS" AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE
AND AMENDING THE UNIFORM BUILDING OODE, 1982 EDITION; THE UNIFCRM BUILDING CODE
STANDARDS, 1982 EDITICN; THE UNIFORM HOUSING CODE, 1982 EDITICN; THE UNIFORM
PLUMBING CODE, 1982 EDITION; THE NATIQNAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 1981 EDITIGN; THE
UNIFORM ELECTRICAL CCDE, 1975 EDITION; AND THE UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF
DANGEROUS BUILDINGS, 1982 EDITICN; AND REENACTING CERTAIN OTHER PROVISIONS FOR
THE PURPQSE OF REGULATING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; AND FOR THE LIMITED PURPCSES
OF SECTICNS 6.409.823 and 6.409.824 AS OONTAINED IN SATD ORDINANCE, THE UNIFORM
BUILDING CODE, 1955 EDITICN

THE PECPLE OF THE CITY OF SANTA ROSA DO ENACT AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Ordinance Numbers 2052, 798, 2054, 2173 and all other ordinances
codified in Chapter 6 of the Santa Rosa City Code entitled "Building Regulaticns”
are hereby repealed.

Sectien 2. There is hereby adopted by reference by the City of Santa
Rosa for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations governing building
activity in the City, providing for the collection of pemmit fees, the issuance
of permits; the adoption of the latest editions of recognized codes; amendment
of such codes, and thus specifically regulating erecticn, construction enlargement,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment,
facilities, height, area, and maintenance of buildings and/or structures in the
city; including electrical, gas, plumbing, mechanical, and similar installations,
and the maintenance and operaticn of such systems; including regulations applying
to the construction and maintenance of fences, vehicle parking lots, swimming
pool, signs, yard drainage systems; grading and excavation of land; the construction
of public improvements; the construction of underground electrical services and
television cable facilities; providing For stream bank protecticns; providing
standards applying to the foregoing; providing for the abatement of unsafe
buildings, those certain codes known as the UNIFGRM BUILDING CODE, 1982 Editiaon,
including tables and appendices thereto, published by the International Conference
of Building Officials; the UNIFORM BUILDING COLE STANDARDS, 1982 Edition, including
tables and appendices thereto, published by the International Conference of
Building Officials; the UNIFORM HOUSING CODE, 1982 Edition, published by the
Internaticnal Conference of Building Officials; the UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE, 1982
BEditicn, published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials; the UNIFORM ELECTRICAL CODE, 1975 Edition, including tables and
appendices thereto, published by the Pacific Coast Electrical Asscciaticn; and
the NATIGNAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 1981 Edition, including tables and appendices thereto,
published by The Naticnal Fire Protection Association; and the UNIFORM CODE FOR
THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS, 1982 Editicn, published by the Interpational
Conference of Building Officials; and for the limited purposes of Secticns 6.409.823
and 6.409.824 as contained in said ordinance, the UNIFORM BUILDING CODE, 1955 Edition,
including earthquake provisions, including appendices thereto, published by the
International Conference of Building Officials; being the whole thereof save and
except such portions as are hereinafter deleted modified, or amended.

Section 3. Articles I, IT and IIT of Chapter 6, BUILDING REGULATICNS,
of theSantaR)saCityOodearemrebyemactedtoxeadandprovidaasfollws:

P. 1/26

CHAPTER 6. BUILDING REGULATICHNS
Article I. General Administration
Division 1. Ceneral

Sec. 6.110.010. Purpose.

This chapter is adopted as the Building and Safety Code of the City of Santa Rosa,
adopting by reference the Uniform Codes set forth hereafter, with such amendments and
deletions as noted. The regulations set forth below are additions and/or amendments to
those Uniform Codes, and where any Uniform Code provisions are in conflict therewith, it
ic the intent of this ordinance to amend or delete:such conflicting rules or regulations
so that this ordinance shall be controlling.

Sec. 6.110.020. Exemptions fram Permit Requirements.

Permit fees and plan check fees as provided in this chapter shall be collected for
all work in the City performed by or for the City, Cownty, State, United States of Arerica,
or any agency thereof, except where exempt under law.

Sec. 6.110.030.. Persons to Whom Permits may be Issued.

Permits for building, construction, alteration, repair, electrical work, plumbing
work, mechanical work and all other work shall be issued only on the application of the
holder of a contracting license issued by the State, licensing such person to engage in
the type of work anticipated by the application for such permit, except that owners'
permits may be issued as provided by law.

Sec. 6.110.040. Building Official to Enforce State Housing Regulaticns.

The Building Official of the City is hereby designated as the enforcament officer
within the City of Divisicn 13, Part 1.5 of the Health and Safety Code of the State and
the Building Official of the City is hereby charged with the enforcement of all the
provisions of such Division 13, Part 1.5 of the Health and Safety Code of the State within
the City and shall in such capacity enforce the provisions of the State Housing Act with
reference to buildings unfit for human habitation or occupancy.

Sec. 6.110.050. Board of Building Requlaticn Appeals: Created; Purpose;
Camposition; Appointment; Duties.

In order to determine the suitability of alternate materials and types of construc—
tion and to provide for reascnable interpretations of the provisions of this chapter,
there shall be and is hereby created, a Board of Building Regulations Appeals, consisting
of seven members, who are active in their field and are qualified by experience and
training to pass upon matters pertaining to building construction, including but not
iimited to electrical, plumbing and mechanical work. The Board shall consist of (1) a
General Contractor; (2) a Structural Engineer or a Civil Engineer specializing in struc-
tural work, (3) a Civil Engineer, (4) an Architect, (5) an Electrical Engineer or
Electrical Contractor, (6) and (7) a Mechanical Engineer or Mechanical Contractor or
Plumbing Contractor. The Building Official shall be an ex-officio member and shall act as
secretary of the Board.

Ord. 2302 P. 2/26



Members of the Board of Building Regulation Appeals shall be appointed by the City
Council, A member of the Board shall serve at the pleasura of the City Council and may be
removed by the affirmative vote of four members of the City Council. The initial temm of
a person appointed to the Board shall be two vears., If a member of the Board is reap-
pointed to a secand term or additicnal oconsecutive texms, each such tam shall be four
years,

Sec., 6.110.055. Fomm of Appeal..

Any affected perscn may appeal from any notice oxder or any action of tha Builéing
Officlal under this Code by filing at the office of the Building Official a written appeal
containing:

1. A heading in the words: "Before the Board of Appeals of the City of Santa Rosa."

2. A capticn reading: "Appeal of .....," giving the names of the appellants
participating in the appeal.

3. A brief statement setting forth the legal interest of each of the appellants in
the building or the land involved in the notice and order.

4. A brief statement in ordinary and cuncise language of the specific order or
action protested, together with any material Facts claimed to support the con-
tentions of the appeliant,

3+ A brief statement in ordinary and concise of the relief sought, and the
reascns why it is claimed tha protested order or action should be reversed,
modified, or otherwise set aside,

6. The signatures of all parties named as appellants, and their official mailing
addresses, .

7. The verification {by declaration under penalty of perjury} of at lsast une
appellant as to the truth of the matters stated in the appeal.

The appeal shall be filed within 15 days from the date tha notice of the decision or
action of the Puilding 0fficial was mailed or delivered, whichever is carlier, to the
peracn to whom the decision ox action is addressed,

Sec. 6.110.060. Procedures for Appesls.

The findings and determinations of the Board of Building Regulation Appeals is a
final de¢ision notwithstanding the provisions of Article V, Section 2.400, et sey.
Chapter 2 of the Santa Rosa Clity Code.

Sec. 6.110.070. Penalty for Violation of Certain Sectiomm.

(a} Any person vioclating any of the provisions of this Chapter, including but not
limited to adopted Uniform Codes as amended herein, shall be quilty of a misdemeanor and
shall be punished by a fine of not more than three lundred dollars ($300) or by imprison-
ment for not more than ninety (90) days, or both. such viplatien shall be deemed a
separate offense for each day or portion therecf during which such violation continues.

Ord. 2302 P. 3/26

<8

(b) Any viclation of the provisions of this Chapter of the Santa Rosa City Code that
would seriously endanger public health and safety shall be, and the same is hereby declared
to be unlawful and a public nuisance. The City Attorney may in addition to or in lieu of
prosecuting a criminal action hereunder, coamence an action or actions for the abatement
in the manner required by law and may take such other steps to obtain such relief as will
abate or remove such nuisance and restrain and enjoin said violaticns., AlL costs (includ-
ing attorney fees) for abatement of any public nuisance gy be assessed againat the
property, declared to be a public nuisance by the City Council after notice to the affected
proparty cwner and may be collected in the same marner as taxes in the manner provided for
by Govertment Code Sec. 38773.5.

Division 2. Standard Plans, Standard Specifications and Rules and
Requlations

Sec. 6.120,010. Adoption of Standard Plans and Standard Constructicn
Specificationa,

The City Council may, by resolution, adopt City standard plans and standard speci-
fications.

Division 3. Installation of Public Improvements in all Zones of the
City

Sec. 6,130,101, Minimm Recuirements.

No building, structure, or improvement cn any lot or lots shall be constructed ,
relocated, expanded, or altered in an amount exceeding the lesser of $10,000 or twenty-
five percent of the reasonable replacement value of tha exigting structures or improv—
ements on said lot, and no building pexmit shall be isaued therefor, unless one-haif of
the street abutting therecn has been dedicated and improved for the full width of said lot
or lots in accordance with City standards or deferred as provided herein, subject to the
following limitations:

{a) The maximuw area of land to be so dedicated shall not exceed twenty—five
percent of the total area of any lot or lots, and in no event shall such dedi~
cation reduce the lot below the required minimam lot sizes, widths, and areas
specified for a specific zoning district in the Zoniny Ordinance, unless such
less area, width, or depth is approved by the City Comcil., In no case,
however, shall such dedicaticn be required if:

1. Iot depth is reduced to lese than 85 feet.

2. Lot width is reduced to less than 50 feet; 60 feet for corner lots.

3. It area is reduced to less than the minimw required lot size for any lot
within the Zoning Ordinance.

{b) Except as provided herein, no additional improvement shall be required on any
lot where all of the following exist to City standards within the present
dedication contiguous thereto and on adjeining properties located on the same
side of the block: complete roadway, curb, gutter, midewalk improvements, storm
drains, street lights and street txees, ’

Sec. 6.130.110. »Additional Improvements.

Hotwithstanding the provisions of Section 6.130.101 (b), improvements in addition to-
roadway, curb, gutter, and sidewalk may be required as a conditicn of granting any entitle~
ment to use where the following exist:

‘Ord. 2302 P. 4/26



{a) The improvement required as a condition of approval is depicted in the Santa
Posa General Flan as the same exists on the date of app.:oval for the entitlement
to use; or,

(b) The i t required as a condition of approval is depicted
in a Specific Plan as the same existe on the date of approval for the entitle-
ment to use; or

(c} The improvement requived as a condition of approval is detemmined
by the City Engineer to be necessary by reason of increased traffic congestion,
impeded traffic circulation, or other deleterious results created or increased
by the applicant's proposed use.

(d} The Ca.ty may share in the cost of such additicnal improvements pursuant to the
provisions of Section 6.130.1B80.

Sec. 6.130,120. Dedication Standards.

Street rights of way shall be dedicated in accordance with the width, standards, and
right of way lines in the Circulation Element of tha General Plan of the City or the City
Streots List as the same exists on the date of approval for an entitlement to use. No
dedication shal}l be required under Section 6.130.10) unless the portion of said street to
be dedicated is shown on said Circulation Element of the General Plan or reflected on the
Clty Street List and the width thereof is specified in said Flemant or List except that
tha des:.gnatl.m of any street on any approved mep or General Plan Circulation Element
axhibit or City Street List without specification of the width thereof shall be at those
widths specified in the standard specifications of the City Engineer.

Seq. 6.130,120. _Variance,

The City Engineer may grant a variance from any requirement imposed pursuant to this
Division if, on the basis of the agserted and the evidence sumitted, the City
Engineer’ makes written findings of fact that establish that one or more of the circum
stances get foxth below apply:

(a) That there are special circumstances applicable to the subject property sweh as
size, shape, topography, location, existing improvements, or surrcunding
structures, and that the strict application of the requirements wunder this
Division would result in practical difficulties or unnecessary hardships incon-
sistent with the general purpose and intent of this Division.

{b) That the nature and extent of the dedication, improvements, or both, as required
herein, do not bear a reasonable relationship to the proposed use or uses of the
property such that the exactions requirved would exceed the demands or burdens
upen traffic, circulation, and other factors justifying public improvements.

{e) In addition, the City Engineer must find that the granting of such variance will
not be materially detrimental to the public welfare or injuricus to the property
in the same zone and vicinity in which the property is located.

See, 6,130,131, Waiver of Requirements.

Notwithstanding the requirements of Sections 6.130,101 and 6.130,110, the City
Engineer shall grant a waiver of all such requirements when, and only when, the reloca-
tiong, expansions, repairs, alterations, or other dmovovements to which they otherwise

Ord. 2302 P. 5/26

would apply are being undertaken and constructed with financial assistance provided by or
under one or rore of the City of Santa Rosa Housing Authority's housing rehabilitation
loan programs; provided, however, that the City BEngineer shall not grant such a waiver
with respect to required sidewalk improvements when, in his judgment, a walver would
result in the continuance or the creation of a hazardous condition or conditions in the
sidewalk area abutting the property being so improved.

Any waiver granted by the City Ergineer under the prowvisions of this section shall be
limited sclely to those relocations, expansions, repairs, alterationg or cther improve-
ments which are financially assisted by or through one of the identified housing rehabili-
tation loan programs: Such a waiver shall not apply to later improvements to property
which are not sc financially assisted and a waiver shall not exempt any property from
participating in and contributing to any assessment district which may be formed to
provide public improvements which benefit the property.

Aopeal.

Any person reguired to dedicate land or make improvements under the provisions of
this Division may appeal any final deciszion made hereunder to the City Council pursuant to
the proviaions of Article V, Section 2.400, et seq. of Chapter 2 of the Santa Fopa City
Code,

Zec. 6.130.140.

The City Council may grant such variances of the requirements hereunder consistent
with the provisions of Section €.130.130 and as long as each such vexiance is in con-
formity with the general spirit and intent of this Article,

Sec, 6.130.150, Improvement and Dedication in Conmection with the -
Granting of a zone Change, variance, or Conditional
Use Permit,

In addition to the provisions of this Article, any City official, board, or agency
responsible for granting any change of zone, conditicnal use permit, zoning variance, or
cother entitlements to use may, as a condition of issusnce of the same, require the dedi-
cation and improvement of street rights of way or other inprovement whether or not desig-
nated on any General or Specific Plan or Street List of the City, where sald conditien
would pramote the public peace, health, and safety by alleviating inoressed traffic
congestion, inpeded traffic circulation, or other deleterious results occasioned by the
improvewent of such property under such a propesed zone change, variance, conditional use
permit, or other entitlement to use.

Sec. 6.130.160, Permits Invalid.

The issuance or granting of ahy permit or entitlement to use shall not be deemed or
construed to be a pemit or entitlewent for, or approval of, any viclation of any of the
provisions of this Code. No permit or entitlements presuming to give authority to viclate
or cancel the provisions of this Division shall be invalid.

Sec. 6.130,170. Agreements to Improve.

In lien of any required improvement under this Division, the official board or agency
authorized or required to accept the same may, in its discretion, enter into an agreement
with the owner, secured by cash, surety bond, or other security guaranteeing the installa-
tion of said improvements. Such Agresments and security shall be subject to the approval
of the City Attorney.

Ord. 2302 P. 6/26



Sec. 6.130,180. City May Share Cost of Making Improvements.

Notwithstanding any provisions of this Article to the contrary, the City Council may
by resolution, order City contributions toward the cost of acquisition or making any
improvement reguired under the provisions of this Division where it determines that the
strict application of this Division to any property owner greatly in excess of the cost or
detriment to other property owners who are required to make improvements under the pro-
visiona of this Division in the immediate vicinity of the said inprovement.

ARTICLE II. PERMITS AND FEES

Divigion 1. Permita

Sec. 6.210.110. Applicability.

Any persan desiring to perform work regulated by curzently adopted editions of the
Uniform Codes, and/or any amendments, ordinances, or other requlations administered by the
Building Division, or that may be adopted and administered in the future, shall secure
pennits and pay fees as set forth herein, These feea shall suparsede any fees set forth
in Uniform Codes adopted by reference in thia ordinance.

The determination of valuation under any of the provisions of this Code shall be made
by the Building Official. The valuation to be used in cumputing the permit and plan
review fees shall be the total value of all construction work for which the pencit is
issued as well as all finish work, painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air
conditioning, elevators, fire extinguishing systems, paving, profit, and overhead, and any
other permanent work or permanent equipment,

Divigsien 2. Deparmént of Community Development Permit fee Table,

Sec, 6,220.110, Single Forms.

The Department of Commmity Develomment shall issue pexmits heretofore required,
including but not limited to grading permits, building permits, plutbing permits, mech-
anical permits and electrical permits on a single form which designates these permits. The
permit fee shall be based on the cumilative value of all the work for which a pemit is
sought.

(a) Fees for the issuance of such pemmits shall be payable in the amounts fixed hy
resolution of the City Council based an the valuation listed therein, The fees
shall be charged and collected at the time of issuance of the permit.

(b} A permit is for any change in the character or use of any building
which would place the building in a different division of the same grouwp of
occupancy or in a different group of cooupancies. The minimm permit fee for
such change shall be $10.00, unless otherwise provided by the fee schedule
adopted by rescluticn of the City Council,

(c} Permits may be cancelled if no construction work has been started and refunds,

if any, may be granted in accordance with the procedure established in Sec.
6.250.111.

Ord. 2302 P, 7/26

ar

Division 3. Plan Review Fees

Bec. 6,230.110. Fees,

A plan review fee shall be paid to the Director of Commnity Development at the time
of submitting plans and specifications for review. Such plan review fee shall be payable
in the amount: fixed by the fee schedule adopted by the City Council by rescolution.

Sec, 6.230.111. Additicnal Plan Review

Where additional plan review is required due to and including but not limited to
incomplete or changed plans, an additional plan review fee shall be charged at a rate
established by the Building Official.

Sec. 6.230,112, Expiration of Plan Review.

Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days following the date of
application shall expire by limitation and plans and other data submitted for review may
thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the building official. The
building official may extend the time for action by the applicent for a pericd not exceed-
ing 180 days upon written request by the applicant showing that circumstances beyond the
control of the applicant have prevented action from being taken. No application shall be
extended more than once. In order to renew action on an application after expiration, the
applicant shall resulmit plans and pay a new plan review fee.

Divigian 4. Public Pacilities Improvement Fees.

Sec. 6.240.110. Findings

The Council of the City of Santa Fosa finds that the continued develcpment of resi-
dential units in the City has resulted in an increased use of certain public facilities
with the result that some are now overburdened and extended beyond their capacity or will
beccre 50 in the near future if residential development continues. There is a need to
increase the capacities of such facilities. In addition, continued residential develop-
ment has created a need for cortain new public facilities., Tha City Council further finds
that due to the present limitations on revenue sources available to the City, the City is
without funds to provide for the necessary construction of certain new or expanded major
public improvements made necessary by the continued residential development in the City.
The fees required by this Article are found and declared to be necessary for the sub—
stantial preservation of the public health, safety, and general welfare by causing the
cost of the construction of these necessary public improvements to ke borne by those
residential developments generating the need for such improvements.

The City Engineer has examined the area within the ultimate residential growth
bomdaries of the City, as shown on the City's General Plan, and identified thereon those
public facilities and improvements (streets, traffic signals, storm drainage, parks, and
police and fire facilities) which either are now non-existent or presently deficient in
terms of capacity, but which will be required and will be necessary to meet the improve-
ment standards and residential service levels which are depicted in the City's General
Plan when the City is fully developed., 'The City Engineer has on file a map and a list
containing a description of all such non-existing or presently deficient capital improve-
ments, and their corresponding current cost estimates. The Council approves the map, the
identified public facilities and improvements, and their cost estimates shown on the list.
The Planning Director of the City has on file a map depicting all properties within the
ultimate residential growth boundaries of the City which are eligible for further develop-
ment and utilizing the zoning and develomment policies of the City has determined the

Ord. 2302 P. 8/26



estimated total residential units still to be developed within the subject boundaries.
The Council approves and concurs in the estimates. The Council reserves the right to
review, from time to time as the Council deems appropriate, all such maps, lists and

estimates and to change apd revise the same, or any one of them, as conditions change.

From and after the effective date of this ordinance, the Council finds, determines,
and deciares that no development within the City over which same department or agency of
the City has discretionary approval, would be approved but for the payment of the fees
required by this ordinance.

Sec, 6.240.111., Definiticns.

(a) "Residential Dwelling Unit" shall mean and include any structure or rot or
group of rooms within a structure designed for human occupancy as a place of abode for cne
Or more persons living together as a family unit, A single family residence is ane
residential dwelling unit, and a duplex and fowplex constitute two and four residential
dwelling units respectively. A pad for a mobile home 1s a structure which is a residential
dwelling unit within the meaning of this Article. Fach apartment within an apartment
house constitutes a single residential dwelling unit.

Sec. 6.240.112. rayment of Feeg,

Every parson constructing or creating a residential dwelling unit within the City
shall pay a public facilities improvement fee for each residential dwelling wit con-
structed, The fee imposed by this Article shall be reviewed at least annually and may be
changed] following such review by resolutiom of the City Council. Such changes shall be
based on cost as reflected in the Construction Cost Index, or other authoritative index of
constructicns costs, and any other relevant circumstances.

Sec. 6.240.113., Time of Payment.

The fees imposed by this Article shall be due and pald for prior to the issuance of a
building permit for the construction of the residential dwelling wnit or units. The fees
chall be payable at and collected by the City's Department of Commmity Develepment.

Seq. 6.240.114. ReFunds.

There shall be a refund of said improvement fee paid hereunder in the event that the
residential structure for which the fee was paid is not comstructed, in vhole or in part,
and the building pemmit therefore has lapsed or is otherwise voided,

Sec. 6.240.115. Administration of Taprovement Fee Revenve,

211 sums collected under this Article-shall be deposited in a separate public facil~
ities improvement fee fund and such suws shall ba used solely for the project costs of
those capital facilites and improvements which are depicted and itemized on the map and
improvement list presently on file with the City Engineer or in any future revisions or
replacements of such map or list. Project costs shall include the project's engineering
costs, administrative costs, construction costs, and right of way acquisition costs.

Ho suus collected under this Article shall be used for public facilities or improvements
which are required to be constructed as a condition of any other devolopment requlations
or requivements of the City. The sums collected under this Article may not be loaned to
or borrowed by other funds of the City. However, sums collected under this Article may be
used to refund to a residential developer the cost of capital improvements, shown on the
Engineer's list, when such a developer has installed such improvements at his own cost.

Ord. 2302 #. 9/26

Such refunds shall only be made in accordance with terms and conditicns set by the City
Council and agreed to by a developer pricr to the installation of any such improvements,

Sec, 6.240,116 Exemptions

Any residential construction which meets the following criteria shall be exempt from
the public facilities improvement fee:

(a) An alteration or addition to an existing residential dwelling
unit which does not constitute an addition thereto of one or
more new <dwelling units.

{b) Demolition of an existing residential structure and the building
of a new structire on the same site where additional dwelling
units are not created, provided the demolished structure was
in use asg a residential dwelling within two years of the
issuance of a building permit for the new residential structure.

-~ Division 5. Permit Fees

Sec. 6.250.110, Fees.

The Permit fees shall be fixed by the fee schedule adopted by the City Council by
resolution,

Sec. 6.260.111 Fee Pefunds.

(a} The buil@ing official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid
hereunder which was exrronecusly paid or collected.

(b) The building official may authorize the refunding of not moye than
80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under
a permit.

le) The building official may authorize the refunding of not more than
80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an application for a
pexmit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or
cancelled before any plan reviewing is done.

(@) The building official shall not authorize the refinding of any fes
paid except upon written application filed by the original permittee
not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

Divigion 6. Miscellaneous Fees.

Bee. 6,260.110. Reinspaotion Fees

Reins ion Fees. A reinspection fee as fixed by the fee schedule adopted by the
City m%fﬁm shall be charged and collected for each extra inspection made
necessary as follows:

(a) Work not ready at time reguested for inspection.

ORd, 2302 P, 10/26



{b) Work required to be corrected on previcus inspection not ready
and/or coxrection not made at time requested for inspection.

Sec. 6.260.111 Information Inspecticn Pee:

An inspecticn fee fixed by the fee schedule adopted by the City Council by resolution
shall be charged and collected for inspections made on request for information that
requires on-site inspection. :

Sec. 6.260.112. Investigation Fees: Work Without a Pemmit.

{a} Investigation, Whenever any work for which a pemit is required
W. mg 2% has been comenced without first oktaining said permit, a special
investigation shall be made before a permit may be issued for such work.

{b) Fee. An investigation fee, in additien to the pexmit fee, shall be
collected whether or not a pemnit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation
fee shall be equal to the amount of the pemmit fee required by this code, The
payment of such investigation fee shall not esempt any person from copliance with
all other provisions of this code nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

Sec. 6.260.113.
Exception: The above provision, Sec. 6.260,112 shall not apply to emergency work
[~ it shall be proved to the satisfaction of the administrative auvthority that such
work was urgently necessary and that it was not practical to cbtaln a permit therefor
before the camencement. of work. '

Sec. 6.260.1314. Residential Building Review Report:

Upcn application by a residential property owner or his authorized agent and upnn
payment of a fee fived by tllualfee schedule adopted by the City Council by resolutian for
the first mit plus any additional units cn the same property the Building Official or his
autherized representative shall perform an on-pike inspection of said property and all
mprovements thereon, and shall review pertinent City records and daliver the applicant a
veport indicating any ordinance or building code violations reflected on City records or
observed during inspection and any specitic restrictions on use or develogment: noted
within the City records which are applicable to the subject property.  Said report shall
specifically exclude the under floor area of an improvement.

ARITCLE IIXI AMENDMENTS TO THE (MIFORM COTES
Divisicn 1. UNIFORM BUILDING QOLE
Sec., 6.310.001. Title. (Amended)

:l‘hisdivj.sjnr} stall be known as the UNIFORM BUILDING CODE, and may be cited as such,
For purposes of citation, the UNIFORM BULLDING COLE, including tables and appendices, 1982
Edition, adopted by reference by the City of Santa Rosa, is herehby renumbered by adding
"6.310" or "6.31", am applicable, before the sections of the UNIFORM BUILDING CODE {i.e.,
Sections 101 and 6001 of the UNIFORY BUILDING COLE shall be respectively Section 6.310.101
and Section 6,316.001 of the Santa Rosa City Cods), and amended by making the following
additions and deleticna: - : .

Ord, 2302 P. 11/26

s

Seg, 6,310,302 (d) Master Plans

Master plans may be submitted when permitted by the Building Official. Where master
plans are pexmitted, one set of approved plans shall be returned to the applicant for each
building permit, which set shall be kept on such building or work at all tines during
which the work authorized thereby is in progress. All required plans shall be furnished
by the applicant.

Sec 6.310.414{m) Definition

g5 H
Master plan is any plan that is to be used by the same builders to build the same
building or structure more than once.

Sec. 6.313.202(b) Roof Construction.

) Paragraph 4. Notwithstanding the provisions of subparagraphs 3202(b), (b1, (B)2,
and (b)3, above, ordinary cambustible roof coverings in designated areas of the City are
prohibited: This requirement shall apply to new construction and any rervofings.
"Designated Areas,” as used in this section are as shown on the map entitled, "Special
Roof Covering Areas," which is ard shall remain on file in the City Clerk's offices. The
map may be amended from time to time by resolution of the City Council.

Sec. 6.311.717., Swimming Pools,

Each swinming pool in the City or the lot or parcel of land on which it is located,
shall be adequately fenced to deter small children from reaching such pocl. A pool is
adequately fenced within the meaning of this section if it is surrounded by a fence at
least four and one-half feet high, set back five feet or more from the edge of the pool on
all sides with gate or gates to match, self~-closing and self~latching as to deter access
by small childrven when unattended, or when the lot or parcel of land cn which the pool ism
located is fenced at or near the lot lines by a fence at least four and one-half feet in
height, so built or so connected with buildings or other structures as to enclose the pool
from public ways and other properties, with gate or gates to match, self-closing and self-
latching as to deter access by small childven when tmattended. In cases of wmnusual
topography or other conditions which make literal compliance with this sectiem difficult
or impogsible, the Chief Building Official may approve a system of fences, butldings,
walls or a carbination of safeguards or structures which provide a reasonaple substitute
for the fences remquired otherwise. This section applies to all pools within the City
regardless of when constructed and whether or not they contain water. Existing gates
which were legal prior to the effective date of this Article may have their existing use
continued provided they are maintained in a closed position and provided such continuved
use is not dangerous.

Sec, 6,312,516 (¢}12 General Construction Requirements:; Protectieon Against
Decay and Termites: Crawl Space Grade. Add:

Add:

Grade level in underfloor areas shall not be lower than exterior grade wnless
adequate drainage to a positive cutfall is provided. Where any water will collect in the
underflcor area, an approved drainage system shall be provided,

Ord, 2302 P, 12/26



Sec. 6.313,802. Rutomatic Fire-extinugishing Systems.

Sec. 3802,

(a} vhere Required. An autcmatic fire-extinguishing system shall be installed
in the occupancies and locations as set farth in this section.

For special provisions on hazardcus chﬂnicals and magnesium, and calcium carbide,
see the Fire Code,

{b) ALl Occupancies except Group R, Division 3 and Group M. Except for Group

R, Division 3 and Group M Ocoupancies, an autcwmatic sprinkler system shall be installegd:

1. In every story or basement of all buildings when the floor area exceeds
1500 square feet and there is not provided at least 20 square feet of
opening entirely above the adjoining ground level in each 50 lineal feet or
fraction thereof of exterior wall in the story or basement on at least one
side of the building. Openings shall have a minimum dimension of not less
than 30 inches, Such openings shall be accessible to the fire department
from the exterior and shall not be cbstructed in a manner that Five fighting
or rescue cannot be actoplished from the exterigr.

Wnen openings in a story are provided on only one side and the opposite
wall of such story is more than 75 feet from such openings, the story shall
be provided with an approved autcmatic sprinkler system, or openings as
specified above shall be provided on at least two sides of an exterior wall
of the shtary.

If any portion of a basement is located more than 75 feet from openings
required in this section, the basement shall be provided with an approved
autcmatic sprinkler system.

2. At the top of rubbish and linen chutes and in their terminal rooms. Chutes
through three or more flcors shall have additional sprinkler
heatls installed within such chutes at alternate Fleors. Sprinkler heagds
shall be acceasible for servicing.

3. In rooms where nitrate £ilm is stored or handled,
4. In protected combustible fiher storage vaults as defined in the Fire Code.

5, In every atory or basement, of all buildings in Groups A, B, E, H, I, and R
ccevpancies, regardless of type of construction when the building is (a)
three atories or more in height, or (b) axcesds thirty-five feet from grade
to the finished ceiling or exposed roof, Exgeption: A sprinkler system
required under (b) of thia paragraph may be amitted when the area above 35
feet is provided for aesthetic purposes only and is unused and unocoupied.

6. The respective increases in area and height specified in Secticn 6,310.506
and 6.310.508 shall be permitted and the fire-resistive substitution speci-
fied in Section 6.310.508 shall be permitted. RArea separation walls shall
not be substituted for the required fire sprinkler system.

Ord. 2302 P. 13/26

(c)

fire
feet

In all rooms or above outside areas adjacent to buildings or undernesath a
roof cverhang used for the storage of combustible waste material in conmection
with Group A, B, E, H, I, and R-1 Occupancies. Such sprinklers may be
connected to domestic water supply provided sufficient coverage of the area

is provided and an approved accessible shutoff is provided for each room or
area,

In all buildings converted to condominiums, where the converted use would
require fire sprinklers under this article For new construction.

Grovwp A Occupancies,

Nightclubg, discos, An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in
roums primarily used for entertaining oceupants who are drinking or dining
and wnseparated accessory uses where the total area of such unseparated
rooms and assembly uses exceeds 5000 square feet., For uses to be considered
as separated, the separations shall be not less than as required for a
one-hour occupancy separation. The area of other uses shall be included
unless separated by at least a one-hour ocoupancy separation.

In one-story Group A Occupancies where the floor area exceeds 6000 square
feet and throughout any building having a Group A Occupancy located onoa
floor or mezzanine above the first floor; however, the respective increases
in area ard height specified in Secticn 6.310.506 and 6.310.507 shall be
parmitted and the fire-resistive substitution specified in Section 6.310.508
shall be pexmitted. Area separaticn walls shall not be substituted for the
required fire sprinkler system.

EXCEPTICN: Area separation walls may be substituted for the reguired
Sprinkler system in one-story Group A Oceupancies not exceeding 8000 square
whare the floor area on either side of the area separation wall does not

axcead 6000 square feet.

3

wore

Ord. 2302

Basement. 2an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in basements
classified as a Group A Occupancy when the basement is larger than 1500
square feet in floor area.

Stairs. 2n automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in enclesed
usable space below or over a stairway in Group A, Divisions 2, 2.1, 3, and
4 Occupancies. See Section 330%(f) .,

Other areas. 2n automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in specific
areas of Group A Cocupencies as follows: Under the roof and gridiron, in
the tie and fly galleries, and in all places behind the proscenium wall of
stages; over enclesed platforms in excess of 500 square feet in area; and
in dressing rooms, worksheps and storerooms accessory to such stages or
enclosed platforms.

EBXCEPTIONS :

1. stages or enclosed platfoams open to the auditorium room on three or
sides.

2. Altars, pulpits or similar platfomms and their accessory xuoms.

P 14726



3. Stage gridirons when side-wall sprinklers with 135 degrees F. rated
heads with heat-baffle plates are installed around the entire perimeter of the
stage at points not more than 30 inches belew the gridiron nor more than 6
inches below the baffle plate.

4, Under stage or under enclosed platform areas less than 4 feet in clear
height used exclusively for chair or table storage and lined on the inside with
materials approved] for cne-howr fire-resistive construction.

(d) Group B, Division 2 Occupancies.

In one and two-story Group B Occupancies where the floor area exceeds 6000
square feet on any fleoor or 12,000 square feet on all floors; however, the
area and height increases specified in Sections 4.310.506 and 6.310.507

shall be permitted and the fire-resistive substitution specified in Section
6.410.508 shall be permitted. Area separation walls shall not be substituted
for the required fire sprinkler system.

EXCEPTICN: Area separation walls may be substituted for the required
fire sprinkler system in Group B, Diviasion 2 Occupancies not exceeding 8000
square feet an any floor or 16,000 square feet on both floors where the floor
area either side of the area separatim wall does not exceed 6000 square feet on
any floor.

In buildings vsed for high~piled cambustible storage, fire protection shall
be in accordance with tha Fire Code.

{e) Greup E Occupancies,

1. Bassitents. An autgmatic sprinklex system shall be installed in basements
classified as a Group F Occupancy when the basoment is larger than |
1500 square feet in floor area. :

2., Staira. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in enclosed
usable below or ovex a stairway in Group E Qocupancies. See
Section 330%({f).

3. In one-story Group B, Division 1 Ocoupancies where the floor area
exceads 6000 sguare feet and throughout any bullding having a Group E
Oceupancy located on a flcor or mezzanine above the first floor;
ewever, the respective increases in area and height specified in
Section 6.310.506 and 6.310.507 shall be pemitted and the fire-
resistive substitution specified in Section 6.310.508 shall be permitted.
Area separation walls shall not be substituted for the requived fire
sprinkler system.

EXCEPTICN: Area separation walls may be substituted for the requirved fire
sprinkler systam in one-story Group B, Division 1 Occupancies not exceeding 8000
square feet where the floor area on either side of the area separation wall does
not exceed 6000 square feet.

ies.

1.  Division 1. A fire-extinquishing system shall be installed in Group
H, Division 2 Ocoupancies exceeding 1500 square feet in floor area.

(f) Gr il

Ord. 2302 P. 15/26

S

2.  Division 2. A fire-extinguishing system shall be installed for
Group H, Division 2 Ccouparwies exceeding 1500 wquare feet in area.

A fire-extinguishing system shall be installed in rooms of Grouwp H,
Divigion 2 Occupancies when flammable or combustible liquids are
stored or handled in excess of the quantities set forth in Table

No. %-A, or any cobination of flammable liquids exceeds 240 gallons,

A five-extinugishing system shall be installed in paint spray booths
Or YOG,

3. Division 3. A fire-extinguishing system shall be installed in
Group H, Division 3 Cocoupancies larger than 3000 square fest in
floor area.

4. Division 4. In Group H, Division 4 Occupancies more than one-story
in height or where the floor area exceeds 6000 square feet; however,
the respective increases in area and height specified in Sections
6.310.506 and 6.310,507 shall be permitted and the fire-resistive
substitution specified in Section 6.310.508 shall be permitted. Area
separation walls shall not be substituted for the regquired fire
sprinkler system.

EXCEPTION: Area separation walls may be substituted for the required fire
sprinkley system in one-story Group H, Division 4 Ocoupancies not exceeding 8000
square feet, where the floor area on either side of the fire separation wall dees
not exceed 6000 square feet.

In rooms where flammable or combustible liquids are stored or hardled in excess

of the qguantities set forth in Table No. 9-A, or any cambination of flammable liguids
totaling 249 gallons, as defined in the Fire Code.

(g} Growp I Ocoupancies.

Group I Occupancies.
EXCEPTIONS

An autcmatic sprinkler system shall be installed in

1. In hospitals of Types I, II Fire-resistive and II One-howr constructicn,
the automatic sprinkler system may be cmitted from operating, delivery, cardiac,
X-ray and intensive care rooms and patient sleeping rooms not exceeding 450 square
feet in area when each such room is provided with smoke detectors connected to a
continuously attended station or location within the building. Increages for area
and height specified in Sections 506(d) and 507 shall not apply when this exception
is used.

2, In jails, prisons and reformatories, the piping system may be dry, provided
a manually operated valve is installed at a continuously monitored location.
Opening of the valve will cause the piping system to be charged. Sprinkler heads
in such systems shall be equipped with fusible elements or the system shall be
designed as required for deluge systems in U.B.C. Standard No. 38-1.

Sec. 6.313.808 Access for Fire Fighting Fouipment.

‘whenever any hydrant or other appurtenance for use by the Fire Department ia requirved
to be installed under the provisions of this €hapter 6 or whenever all or a substantial
part of any building ox structure is or becomes in excess of seventy-five feet {75} feet
from a safe and adequate access road, there shall be provisions for access to and from

ord. 2302 P. 16/26



every such building, hydrant, and appurtenance by fire fighting equipment. Said
aceess shall be in the form of an improved permanently maintained roadway or open paved
area, or any combination thereof designed, constructed, and at all times maintained in
such a manner that there shall be an access way kept clear and unobstructed at such
grades and having sufficient width and teight clearance to permit ingress and egress
by fire fighting eguipment.,

Division 2. WRIFORM HOUSTNG CODE

Sec, 6,320,001, Title.

This division shall be known as the UNIFORM HOUSING OODE, and may be cited as such.
For purposes of citation, the UNIFORM HOUSING CODE, including tables and appendices,
1582 BEdition, adopted herein by reference by the City of Santa Rosa, is hereby renumbered
by adding "6.320." or "6.32.", as applicable, before the sections of the UNIFORM HOUSING
CODE (i.e., Secticons 101 and 1612 of the UNIFORM HOUSING ODDE shall be respectively
Section 6,320.101 and Section 6,321.612 of the Santa fosa Clty Code.)

Division 3. UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

Sec. 6.330.001. Title.

This division shall be known as the UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE and may be cited as such.
For purposes of citation, the WIFORM PLUMBING COCE, including tables and appendices,
1982 Editicn, adopted herein by reference by the City of Santa Fosa is remmbered by
adding "6.330." or "6.33" as applicable, before the sections of the UNIFORM PLUMBINCG
e (l.e., Sectmns 10.1 and 1325 of the UNIFORM PLIMBING CODE shall be respectively
Section 6,330,101 and Sections 6.331.325 of the Santa Rosa City Code), and deleting
therefrom Section 207 relating to fees.

Division 4. UNIFORM ELECTRICAL CODE

Sec. 6.340.001, Title.

This division shall be known as the UNIFORM EIECTRICAL COLE, and may be cited as
such. For purposes of citation, the UNIFORM ELECTRICAL OOLE, including tables and
appendices, 1975 Edition, adopted herein by reference by the City of Santa Rosa is
renuavbered by adding "6.340.10" or "6.340.1" as applicable, before the sections of
the UNIFORM ELECTRICAL COPE (i.e., Sections 1 and 14 of the UNIFORM ELBECTRICAL QODE
sha.l.;. be respectively Section 6.430.101 ard Section 6.340.114 of the Santa Rosza City
Code) .

Sec. 6.340.101h (CHIEF FLECTRICAL INSPECTOR: Amended)

There is hereby created the office of Chlef Electrical Inspector. The Building
Official of the City of Santa Rosa shall be the Chief Electrical Inspector.

Sec. 6.340.103. Fees for Permits and Inspection.

Delete Section 103 of the UBC. Add:

A fee of $10.00 cr as fixed by the fee schedule adopted by resolution by the City
Coumeil shall be paid for each annual maintenance electricial permit at the time when
such permit is issued. Fees for all new work installed under such a permit since the
date of the last previous inspection shall be paid, according to the permit fee above,
at the time when such work is inspected; these fees shall be in additiom to the annual
maintenance electrical permit fee.

Ord. 2302 P. 17726

Division 5. NATTONAL ELECTRICAL CCDE

Sec. 6.350,001. Title.

This division shall be known as the NATIONAL FLECTRICAL CODE, and may be cited
ag such, For purposes of citation, the NATIGNAL ELECTRICAL COLE, including tables
and appendices, 1981 Edition, adopted herein by reference by the City of Santa Rosa,
is hereby remumbered by adding "6.340.0" or "6.350." as applicable, before the article
mmbers of the NATIONAL ELBECTRICAL CODE (i.e., Article Nuwbers 90 and 820 of the
NATTONAL ELBCTRICAL COIFE shall be respectively Section 6.350.909 and Section 6.340,820
of the Santa Rosa City Code).

Division 6. UNIFORM MECERANICAL QODE

Sec. 6.360.001. Title

This division shall be known as the UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE, and may be cited as
such. For purposes of citation, the UNIFORM MBCHANICAL CODE, including tables and
appendices, 1982 Fdition, herein by refersnce by the City of Santa Rosa, is
hereby renunbered by adding "6.360" or "6.36" as applicable, before the sections of
the UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE (i.e., Secticn 101 and 2004 of the UNIFORM MECHANICAL
QCDE shall be respectively Section 6.360.101 and Section 6.362.004 of the Santa Rosa
City Code), and Section 304 is hereby deleted.

Division 7. UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS

Sec. 6.370.001. Title.

Thig division shall be kncwn as the UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANCERCUS
BUILDINGS, and may be cited as such. For purposes of citation, the UNIFORM CODE FOR
'THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUIIDINGS, inciuding the tables and append:l.ces, 1982
Edition adopted herein by reference by the City of Santa Rosa, is hereby renmbered
by adding "6.370." hefore the sections of the UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABMNTEMENT OF
DANGEROUS BUIXDINGS (i.e., Sections 101 and 912 of the UMIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT
OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS shall be respectively Secticn 6.370,101 and Section 6.370.912
of the Santa Rosa City Code}.

ARTICLE 1V. EXISTTNG BUILDTNGS: HEVIEW AND ABATEMENT

Sec. 6.40%.820. Purpose.

It is generally acknowledged that the City of Santa Rosa has experienced and
will continue to experience moderate to great earthguakes in the forseeable future.

Many buildings subject to severe hazards continue to be a serious
danger to the life and safety of people who live and work in them in the event of an
earthquake. The primary goal of building reconstruction to reduce earthquake hazards
is the improvement of safety to life. In order to make recenstruction economically
feasible and to the safety of life in seismically hazardcus buildings, the
City of Santa Fosa adopted standards in Resolution 9820 in 1971 which is hereby
repealed and reenacted in certain parts as Article IV of Chapter 6 of the Santa Rosa
City Code.

Sec. 6.409,.82). Preliminary Review.

This Article is to provide procedures for the systematlo survey and reconstruction
of existing buildings within the City of Santa Rosa in order to make reconstruction
econcmically feasible and to improve the safety of life in seismically hazardous

Grd. 2302 P, 18/26



8. Type and strength of wall and parapet anchorage.
9. ‘Type of diaphragms and bracing.
10, Type of interior partitions.

{(b)  The review shall include the determination that the structure either complies
or does not comply with the requirements of the UNIFORM BUTLDING OOCE, 1955
Edition, including earthquake provisions, including appendices therets,
which is hereby adopted by reference for the sole purpuse of conpliance
with this Article. In connection with this preliminary review, extensive
tests shall not be required. If the structure is determined to 50 comply,
it ip exempt from the provisions of this Article.

(o) If the structure is determined not to comply with the UNIFORM BUILDING
-CODE, 1955 Edition, it shall be further reviewed by the property cwner as
provided in the following secticons.

(d) A copy of the reviewer's report shall incliumde but not be limited to:

1. The determination of campliance with the UNIFORM BUILDING CODE, 1955
Edition) and .

2. Where applicable, the findings on which the detemmination that the
building or structure does conply is hased, shall be sent to the
property owner along with any order to abate hazards as provided in
the following sections.

Sec., 6.409.924. Mhatement: Rehabilitation or Demolition.

Those buildinga not meeting the tits of the WNIFORM BUILDING COUE, 1955
Edition, may be abated by rehabilitation or demolition in accoréance with the provision
of this Article. Puildings or hazards which are not voluntarily abated within 365
days of notice to correct deficiencies may be required by the City to be vacated and
abated in accordance with the previsicns of the (NIFORM CDOE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF
DANGEROUS BUILDINGS as adopted in Section 6,370,001, .

Sec. 6,409.825. Property Owner Peview.

Upon notice by City to the property owner to correct deficiencies, the property
owner shall require an engineer to prepare a review of the subject building or styucture,
As soon as the review is prepared, the engineer shall sumit it to the City. The
review shall include, but not be limited to the following:

(a) ILocation by street address and assessor's mmber,

[(b) Type of oocupancy and accurate dimensicns,

(c) Type of construction, type of foundation, and materials used in construction.
Tests, as necessary, shall include but not be limited to the drilling of
inspection holes, the determination of the and quality of materials
and a general description of how these materials ave integrated within the
structure.

{d} Comprehensive review of cmd:p.tm, mzintenance, and fomdation performanca.

{e) Complete vertical load resume, analysis or estimate based cn typical bays
and detalls and all critical areas. .

Ord. 2302 P. 19/26

(f) Investigation, review, and analysis of building elements including but not
limited to walls, parapets, disphragms, shear walls, bracing, attachments
and crnamentation, ceilings, lights, stairs, type and resistance of interior
partitions, presence and adequacy of diaphragm chords, and ties.

{g) Verification of elements of preliminary review regarding maintenance, fire
resistance, and exits.

{h) Such drawings and sketches as necessary to describe building strengths amd
deficiencies,

{1) Summary statement of findings,

{j} sStatement of engineer as to conditions determined as related to codes and
evalustion criteria.

(k} Independent statement of engineer as to his professionsl opinion regarding
the safety of the building in regard to fire, panic, moderate and major
earthquake, with reasons for his opinion, without regard to code requirements.

(1) A statement by the Engineer, in his opinion, as to whether or not special
or unusual factors exist that alleviate or intensity the risk,

{m) Such other information as required by the Building Official.
Bec. 6.409.826. Requirements for Continued Use of Structure.

Reinforcement work and design shall be performed by the property owner, his
representative, agent, or employee under the direct supervision of a structural
engineer or civil engineer specializing in structural work to include but not be
limjted to the following standards: -

{a) The vertical dead load (without live or lateral loads) mist not create any
overstress as related to allowed stresses pursuant to this Chapter, except that
foundations may be assumed to have met the test of time where there is no settlement
or damage.

{b}) The buildirg must meet the requirements of this Chapter for vertical forces
including live load with no more than 15% overstress above curvent codes.

(¢) Walls, parapets, windows, and doors must be adequate for & 15 1b. wind, 20% G on
walls, 50% G on parapets both in spamning between resisting elements and attachments
to supporting elements with no more than 50% increase to stresses in lieu of the
presently allowed 30% increase.

(@) Diaphragms must be capable of resisting present code required lateral forces at
not over 100% increase in normal code values. (Base plus 100% in place of base
plus 33%.) Straight sheathed diaphragms shall not be used to resist lateral
forces in concrete or masenry buildings. €hords and collector elements must be
provided. .

{e) Shear walls must be adequately connected and tied down to foundations. Unreinforced
masonry may be used in shear parallel to plane of wall provided that wall is
securely held in place perpendicular to wall.

(f) Complisnce with the fire and panic rvequirements of the adopted Article ITI of
this Chapter concerning exit requirements, enclosed stairways, fire sprinkler

Ord. 2302 P. 20/26



buildings, The following classificatiens of buildings shall ke subjected to a preliminary

review by the Building Official to determine the general structural characteristios,
the relative safety of the building and its general compliance with this chapter.

(a} All buildings constructed before Decestber 31, 1957 except

public school buildings and cne and two family wood frame dwellir;qs.
(&) 211 buildings using unreinforced masonry walls.
Sec. 6.409.822,  Priority of Review.

) The Preliminary Review of buildings shall be conducted in the following order of
pricrity:

{a) Theaters, hotels, motels, places of public assemblage of
100 persons or more, hospitals, clinics, and govermmantal public buildings.

(b) Puildings adjacent to sidewalks with large voltmes of pedestrian traffic.
{e) Buildings cpen to the general public such as stores, markets, shops, clubs,
restaurants, cffice buildings and public assemblages of less than 100

persons.
{d) Apartments of more than 10 units.
{e) Apartments of 10 units or less.

(f) Shops, garages, warehouses, and other buildings not generally open to the
public which have low cccupancy loads.

(g} Any other buildings.

Sec. 6.409.923. Scope of Preliminary Review by Building Division
of the Department of Community Develomment.

(a} The Building Official or his authorized representative may conduct a prelim-
inary review which may include, but not be limited to the following:

1. Iocation by street address and assesgor's parcel number.
2. Type of occupancy and approximate dimensions,

3. Type of construction and foundations. Type of materials used in
constructicn, .

4. Age of construction. Photos of the building exterior. Comstruction
drawings shall be sulmitted if available,

5. (uality of maintenance, cracks, and cleanliness. Evidence of leaks,
foundation settlement, esagging floors, or rusting metal, and rotting
wood. General deterioration of any other building material used.

6. General five classification of the structure. The classification shall
include the frame, walls, partitiens, floors, roofs, and roof coverings.

7. Number, quality, and type of exits available.

Ord, 2302 P. 21726

systens, fire separations, and panic hardware. Alternative methods of fire protection,

including but not limited to fire sprinkler systems, may be approved by the Fire
Marshal and the Building Official.

ARTICLE V
FLOCD HAZARD ZCHES

Sec, 6.500.001, Purpose.

This Article is adopted to corply with the National Flood Disaster Protection
Act and the National Flood Insurance Program Regulation as published in the Federal
Register, Volume 207, dated October 26, 1976, and shall apply to all areas of special
flood hazards within the jurisdiction of the City of Santa Rosa. The areas of special
flood hazard identified by the Federal Insurance Administration in a scientific and
angineering report entitled "fhe Flood Insurance Study for the City of Santa Rosa,"
dated February 3, 138], with an accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map is hereby
adopted by reference ard is dectared to be a part of this Article, The Flood Insurance
Study is on file in the office of the City Clerk at 100 Santa Fosa Avenus.,

Sec, 6.500.002. Permits Required,

Permit application for approval of any subdivision, building, or other work
within designated flocd prone areas designated pursuant to Federal requirements shall
be accanpanied by documentaticn of elevations (in relation to sea level) of the
lewest habitable floor (including basement) or in the case of flood proofed nonresiden—
tial structures, the elevation to which it has been floodproofed. all preliminary
subdivision proposals shall identify the flood hazard area and the elevation of the
base flood. All final subdivision plans will provide the elevation of proposed
structures and building pads. If the site is filled above the base flood, the final
pad elevations shall be certified hy a vegistered professional engineer., Records of
such documentation or certification of such elevation may be maintained along with
such other information as determined by the Building Official as reasonably necessary.

Bec. 6,500.003 Standards

In reviewing all applications for new construction, substantial improvements,
prefabricated buildings, placement of mcbilehomes, and other development(s) performance
standards including but not limited to the following may be required:

{a) New construction and substantial improverent of any residential structure
shall have the lowest habitable floor (including basement) elevated to or
above the 100-year base flood elevation. *

{b) HNonresidential construction shall either be elevated in conformance with
Section 6,500.003(a) or together with attendent utility and sanitary
facilities.

1. Be flood-proofed so that below the base flood level structure is water
tight with walls substantially impermeable to the passage of water.

2, Hawve styuctural components capable of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodymanic

loads and effects of bouyance.

Ord. 2302 P, 22/26



" 3. Be certified by a registered professional engineer or architect that
the standards of this section are satisfied, Such certificaticns
shall be provided to the Building Official.

(c} That constxuction materials and utility equijment be resistant to flood

(d} That construction methods and practices be used to minimize flood damage.

(e} That the design or anchorage prevent the flotation, collapse, or lateral
mmnt of the structure due to flooding.

(£) The following standards are required for: mobilehomes not placed in mobilshome
parks or subdivisicns; new mobilehame parks or subdivisions; and repair,
reconstruction, or improvements to existing mobilehame parks or subdivisions
that equals or exceeds fifty percent of the value of the streets, utilities
and pads before the repair, reconstruction or improvements commence:

1, All mobilehames shall be placed cn pads or lots alevated on compacted
fill.

2. No@ilelmeahallheplaaedinafloodmy

3, Spec:.flc anchoring requirements for mobilehemes shall include but not
be limited to: Overhead ties at each of the four corners of the
.mobilehome with two additicnal ties per gide at the intermediate
locations; frame ties at each oorner of the home with five additional
ties per _side at intermediate points and mobilehomes less than 50 feet
long recquiring four additional ties per side; all camponments of the
anchoxing system he capable of carrying a force of 4,800 pounds; and
any additions o mobilehomes be simlilarly anchored. §

{g) Evidence that flocod damage shall be minimized.

{h) Evidence that the proposed constructicn or substituticon is reasonably safe
from flooding.

(i) Evidence of adequate drainage to reduce exposure to flood hazards.

{j) Standards for Utilities: All new and replacement water supply and sanitary
sewage systems shall be desighated to minimize or eliminate infiltratiom of
flood waters into the system and discharge from systems into floed waters;
and on-site waste disposal systems shall be located ko avoid impairment to
them or contamination From them during flooding.

(k) Altératicn of Water Courses: Notify adjacent ommmmities and the California
Department of Water Pesources prior to any alteration or relocation of a
water coupse and submit evidence of such notification to the Pederal Ingurance
Adininistration; require that the flood carrying capeoity of the altered or
relocated portion of sald watercourse is maintained.

Sec. 6.500.004. Floodways.,

located within areas of special flood hazatd established by the provisions of
this Article are areas designated as floodways. Since the floodway is an extremaly

Ord, 2302 P, 23/26

hazardous area due to the veloeity of flood waters which carry debris, potential
projectiles, aml eorsion potential, the following provisions apply:

{a) Prohibit encroactments, including £ill, placement of debris, new construction,
substantial improvements, and other development unless certification by a
registered professional engmer is provided demonstrating that encroachwents
shall not result in any increase in flood levels during the ocowrrence of
the hase flood discharge.

(b} If no flocdway is identified then a set-hack of 2-1/2 times the deprt*.h of
the water course plus 30 feet from the bank(s) of the water colrse is
established where encroachment will be prohibited.

Sec, 6,500.005. Use of Base Flcx)d Data.

When base flood elevatmn data has not been provided in accordance with the pro—
visions of this Article the Building Official may obtain, review, and reascnably
utilize any base flood elevation data available from a Federal, State, or other
sowrce, in order to administer the provisions of this Article.

Sec. 6.500.006. Interpretation of FISM Boundaries.

In reviewing all applications the Building Official may take interpretations
where neaded, as to the exact location of the boundaries of the areas of special
fleed hazards. (For example, where there appea.rs to be a conflict between a mapped
bourdlary and actual field conditions.)

Sec, 6,500,007,

This Article shall take precedence over cenflicting sections within this chapter.

ARTICIE VI, BUTIDING SECURTTY
Sec. 6.710.001. Purpose.

Building Security is enacted in erder to prtmote building security,
safequard property and help prevent financial loss by affording resistance to nonforceable
entry into buildings and establish crime prevention through building security, pursuant
to Section 14051 of the California Penal Code providing that the Police, Fire and
Building Officials of the City develop a lecal security standards and requlations.

Sec, 6.710.101, Scope,

(a) Scope. This Article shall apply to all new construction requ.‘l.ring a bullding
permit, including but not limited to existing multiple family dwelling units which
are converted to privately cwned family units (condominiums) and any existing structure
which converts from its original occupancy group as designated in the UNIFORM BUILDING
OCLE to a different ocoupancy.

{b} Exemption. Any building defined in the UNIFORM BUILDING CODE and Title 19,
California Administrative Code and which requires special type mleasmg or latching
devices shall be exempt from the provisions of this Article relative to locking
davices of interior and/or estterior doors.

Ord, 2302 P, 24/26



Sec,.6,710.102, Rules and Requlations.

The City Council may adopt, by resolution, rules and regulations governing the
materials and methods of construction necessary to provide minimem standayds for
safequarding property and public welfare against unlawful entry.

ARTICEE VII. HISTORICAL OR
ARCHITECTURALLY SIGNIFICANT BUILDINGS

sec. 6.910,00L, Purpose.  In order to maintain the historical and architectural
Inteqrity of buildings designated as historical or architecturally significant buildings
within the commmity consistent with cbjectives of the urban design element of the
General Plan, it is necessary to provide necessary code alternatives of rehabilitation
and restoration of said buildings. Such altsrnative building regqulations are intended
to facilitate the restoration or changes of ocoupancy so as to preserve the original
or restored architectural elements and features, to provide a cost effective approach
to the preservation of historical or architecturally significant buildings and to
provide for the safety of the building ts conslistent with the California
Administrative Code under Part 2, Title 25, Chapter B2 "State Historic Building

Code, "

Sec. 6.810.101.

Historic or Architecturally Significant Buildings,

The City Council may, by resoluticn, find and determine that particular buildings
or structures have special historical or architectural significance. Repairs, alterations,
and additions necessary for the preservaticon, restoration, rehabilitation, relocation,
canvergion, or continued use of a building or structure so designated shall cogply
with the requirements of Article IV of this Chapter (Secticn 6.490.820 et seq.) and
upon the written approval of the Building Official, the remainder of such repaira,
alterations or additions may be wndertaken and carpleted in accordance with those
requirementa of the State Historic Building Code as may be applicable, rather than the
other requirements of this Chaptar. In the absence of such written approval of the
Building Official, the repair or alteration of, or additions to, a building or structure so
designated shall comply with all requirements of this Chapter.

Ord. 2302 P, 25/26

Section 4. Findings of Fact.

The City Council £inds that the gtandards of buildings within the community of
Santa Rosa should conply with the UNIFORM BUILDING OCDE, 1982 Edition; the UNIFORM BUIID-
NG CODE STANDARDS, 1982 Editicn; the UNIFORM HOUSING CODE, 1982 Edition: the UNTFORM CODE
FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUXLDINGS, 1982 Editicn; the UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE, 1982
Edition; the UNIPORM EIECTRICAL CODE, 1975 Editicn; and the NATICNAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 1981
Editicn; and for the limited purposes of Section 6,.409.823 and 6.409.824, as contained in
said Crdinance, the UNIFORM BUITOO¥S CODE, 1955 Edition as amended by the provisions of
this Cxrdinance. Based on the reccomendation of the Building Official of the City of Santa
Rosa, the City Council further finds that it is necessary to make the modifications and
changes to the uniform codes specifically adopted in this Ordinance since they are needed
for the more efficient, more econcmical and more expeditious enforcement of the Buiiding
Standards of the City of Santa Rosa. The City Council further finds that the amendments
to this Ordinance are hereby determined to be reasonably necessary because of local
conditions and do not lessen or diminish the standards set forth within the unifomm codes
adopted by this Ordinance except as provided by law.

Said local corditions are:

(a) Because of heavy accumilatidh of flammable plant cover in many areas, pericdic
high winds an extended dry seascn, close proximity of woed frame bulldings in
certain areas, and organizational limitations of the fire department, an
aggravated danger of fire exists requiring the prohibition of crdinary com-
bustible roofs and requiring sprinkler systems.

(b) The propensity of local streams to flood neceasitates special censtructicn
requirements in designated floed hazard zones.

{] The large nunber of swimming pools necessitate fencing requirements.

[d} Local rainfall and gromd water conditions necessitate underfloor
drainage requirements.

(e} Earthquake hazards necessitate the review and abatement provisions set
forth in Article IV, as more particularly stated therein.

gection 5, Severabilily Clause.

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrasz of this Ordirance is for
any reascn held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not agffect the remaining
portiens of this Ordinance. fThe City Council declares that it would have passed this
Ordinance and each section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective
of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses or phrases be
declared unconstituticonal.

Section 6. This Ordinance shall be in full farce and effect fram and after its
adoption and publication or as ston thereafter as all precedents of law have been satisfied.

IN COUNCIL DULY PASSED this 14th day of June, 1983.
AYES: (3) Vice-Mayor Jeffries, Councilmen Barone and orn

NOES:
- A
R F

o).
ABSENT: 2; Mayor Healy, Counciiman BurkartAPP
MT=_1\¥QM,@&%.J’_
ASSISTANT CITY CLERK

Ord. 2302 P. 26/26







